Approved by CC:

RFB 2014-401: Asphalts and Emulsified Asphalts Recap Sheet SEP 93 2013
Opening Date: Sept 12, 2013, 2:00 p.m., at Johnson County Purchasing Office
Vendor Vendor Vendor
Vendor Cleveland Asphalt Southern Asphalt Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions
Address Shepherd, TX Fort Worth, TX Austin, TX
Pickup/FOB Item#/ Pickup/FO Item##/ Pickup/FOB Item#/
Desc. B Desc. Desc.
CRS-2 2.10/2.3236 2.25/2.35 2.50/2.6394
CRS-2H 2.10/2.3236 2.25/2.35 2.50/2.6906
MS-2 2.45/2.6736 2.40/2.58 2.60/2.7906
HFRS-2 NO BID 2.50/2.69 2.50/2.1906
RC-250 3.75/3.9726 3.60/3.85 NO BID
AC-5 3.55/3.7736 2.41/2.57 NO BID
AC-10 3.55/3.7736 2.40/2.56 NO BID
AC-15P 3% NO BID NO BID NO BID
Poly
AC-15XP 2% NO BID NO BID NO BID
Poly
MC-30 4.00/4.2236 3.50/3.90 NO BID
CRS-1P 2.80/3.0236 2.40/2.50 NO BID
P2 Prime NO BID NO BID NO BID
P2 Prime NO BID NO BID NO BID
Emulsifies
Diluted AEP 2.50/2.7236
40% H20 Undiluted 1.94/2.04 2.04/2.1794
50% H20 price per gal; 1.65/1.75 1.73/1.8694
60% H20 no diluted 1.36/1.46 1.41/1.5495
elivery
CWE/CWP2 NO BID NO BID NO BID
(SEE CRS-2)
Hot Pour NO BID NO BID NO BID
Crack Sealer
Other Product
Demurrage $80.00 per hr after first | $90.00 per hr after first | $80.00 per hr after first 2
Rate 2 hrs 2 hrs hrs
Min. Order 5000 gal 6000 gal 5500 gal
Other Fees $150.00 Pump/Hose charge | $80.00 Pump/hose charge;
Ritn freight: ¥ tariff

Attest: Matt Hunt, Heartland Asphalt; Becca Walsh, Buyer; Heather Carmichael, Buyer
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Vendor Vendor Vendor
Vendor Heartland Asphalt Crafco Texas, Inc
Address Hurst, TX
Pickup/FOB | Item#/ Pickup/FOB Item#/ Pickup/FOB Item#/
Desc. Desc. Desc.
CRS-2 2.15/2.29 CRS-2 NO BID
CRS-2H 2.15/2.29 CRS-2H NO BID
MS-2 NO BID NO BID
HFRS-2 NO BID NO BID
RC-250 NO BID NO BID
AC-5 2.95/2.79 AC-5 NO BID
AC-10 2.65/2.79 AC-10 NO BID
AC-15P 3% 3.25/3.39 AC-15P NO BID
Poly
AC-15XP 2% 3.25/3.39 | AC-15XP NO BID
Poly
MC-30 NO BID NO BID
CRS-1P 2.95/3.24 CRS-1P NO BID
P2 Prime NO BID NO BID
P2 Prime NO BID NO BID
Emulsifies
Diluted AEP AEP NO BID
40% H20 2.08/2.22 dilute
1.77/1.91
50% H20 1.!17/ 1.21
60% H20
CWE/CWP2 NO BID NO BID
Hot Pour NO BID $0.59 PER
Crack Sealer LB*
Other Product
Demurrage $80.00 per hr after first
Rate 2 hrs
Min. Order 5600 gal 10,000 Ibs
Other Fees $80.00 pump charge if *Forklift required for
pump is requested; return unloading

loads: Y% tariff




